APPROVED MINUTES
Accredited Standards Committee C63

Electromagnetic Compatibility

Thursday, 28 April 2005   

IEEE Operations Center
445 Hoes Lane, Piscataway, NJ    
1.0
Call to Order – The Chair called the meeting to order at 08:36h.
1.1 Introductions – The Chair asked for a round of self-introductions, and the 

Secretary circulated an attendance sheet. [For a list of Attendees, See Attachment 1]
[NOTE: For the location of the Attachments, see the List of Attachments at the end of these Minutes.]
1.2
Announcements – The Chair thanked Don Heirman, the Vice Chair, for his chairing of the previous meeting, and thanked the IEEE for its hosting the present meeting,
1.3       Dates of future meetings – Don Heirman noted that although the date of the next meeting 
had been announced on the web site as being in October 2005 at NIST in Boulder, CO, he and a number of other individuals in the room had serious conflicts in October, e.g., the IEC General Meeting. Considerable informal discussion followed, following which it was the consensus that the only convenient times for the meeting were the week of 25 September or the week of 12 December, in spite of the shortened times between current or succeeding meeting dates, respectively. Later in the meeting a vote was taken on the two options; there was no objection to September, but there were several objections to December. Accordingly, it was agreed that the meeting of C63 and its SCs would be held on 27-29 September 2005, at a venue not yet specified. (It had been determined that the NIST location was not available on those dates.)
2.0 Agenda

2.1 
Approval of Agenda - 
2.2 Consent Agenda
2.2.1
Approval of Minutes of 28 October 2004.

2.3
Balance of Agenda



2.3.1 Minute 9.5 of 28 October 2004:Meeting: Newsletter Report – The Secretary reported that he had removed from the Consent Agenda the Draft Minutes of the last meeting after realizing that he had omitted the Newsletter Report supplied by Warren Kesselman. It was then moved and seconded that the Draft Minutes of the October 2004 meeting with the addition of the Newsletter Report be approved.
[Motion passed]
3.0
Membership Issues – Dan Hoolihan, Chair of the Membership Committee, displayed a list of the C63 individual members [See Attachment 2], and moved that they be approved

[Motion passed].

Next, he displayed a list of the C63 organizational members [See Attachment 3], and moved that they be approved.

[Motion passed]

4.0
C63 Trademark Issue – The Chair briefly reviewed the background on this item, and noted that he had been unable to address the issue, but planned to do so shortly.
ACTION ITEM 05-04/001 – Dr. Showers shall address the C63 trademark issue and report to C63 at its next meeting.
5.0
C63 Standards– Status Reports – The Secretary reported that he had received only one response to Action Item 06 from the November 2004 meeting requesting suggestions for revising the Status Report and assigned to all C63 members (The response: “It would be useful to have it posted to the C63 web site.”) Don Heirman requested that we keep that Action Item open.
ACTION ITEM 04-10/06-REV – Members of C63 that have suggestions for revising the Status Report should communicate these suggestions to the C63 Secretary by 1 July 2005.
5.1
C63.2 - EM Noise & Field Str. Instr. – Mike Windler briefly described the background of this project and reported that he had revised the C63.2 Draft and had e-mailed it to the Secretary. The Secretary then agreed to:

ACTION ITEM 05-04/002 – The Secretary shall initiate the recirculation ballot for C63.2 by 15 May 2005.
[NOTE of the Secretary – The revised Draft did not comprise all of the material necessary for the recirculation ballot. Initiation of the recirculation ballot therefore will be delayed.]
5.2 C63.4 – Revisions – Stephen Berger reported that effort on revising C63.4 has been 
delayed because of pressures from C63.17 and C63.19, but that he expected to be able to report more progress at future C63 meetings. In response to a query from the Chair, Stephen stated that he expected to have a Revised version ready for ballot after the April 2006 meeting.
5.3 C63.5 – Antenna Calibration – Don Heirman reported that C63.5-2004 had been made 
available for sale on 20 December 2004, and he emphasized that this version replaces both prior Versions, i.e., 1988 and 1998.
5.4 C63.7 – OATS, Construction of – The Secretary reported that the documentation for 
requesting final approval of C63.7 had been submitted to ANSI, but the ANSI response (which was expected) was to defer action on C63.7 and to take steps to conduct  a formal audit of C63,  which now is underway.
5.5 C63.8 – Compendium – Don Heirman led discussion on this item. The Secretary reported 
that he had received ten responses to Action Item AI 08 of the November 2004 meeting, requesting all Members to provide information on how to find EMC standards efforts in their organizations, and he briefly summarized those responses. Considerable discussion arose over exactly what information actually was wanted, and in conclusion, Don stated that a list of EMC standards developed by each C63 Member’s organization was the goal.

5.6 C63.12 – EMC Limit setting – The Secretary reported that he had received only four 
responses to Action Item AI 09 of the November 2004 meeting, requesting all Members to review C63.12, and identify changes and/or improvements which could be made in the standard. The Chair then assigned:

ACTION ITEM 05-04/003 – The C63 Steering Committee shall follow up on the responses to Action Item 09 of the November 2004 meeting.
                   
5.7
C63.15 – Immunity Meas. & Instr. – Mike Windler reported that there were numerous editorial errors in the previously circulated Draft of C63.15 and that he would correct them and also put the document in the new format described at the C63 Training Session on Monday.
:
ACTION ITEM 05-04/004 – Mike Windler by 13 May shall prepare a revised Draft of C63.15 in the new Format and with previously reported errors corrected.
Jeff Silberberg voiced concern about objections he had received to his proposing corrections in unchanged portions of the recirculated document. Mike responded, stating that Jeff’s review had been appreciated, but pointed out that continually noting editorial errors could be a never-ending process.

5.8
C63.16 – ESD Test Methodologies – The Chair apologized for the delay in processing 
this Standard. Most of the comments received on the previous ballot were editorial, but a few were of the type ”there is no need for a C63 Standard on this subject”. In any event, the Chair stated that he needs assistance in progressing this project, with an individual or a group of individuals familiar with electrostatic-discharge technology. Mike Violette volunteered as did Jeff Silberberg, Bob DeLisi agreed to template the document, and Ken Hall volunteered an editor-type individual. Accordingly, the following Actions were assigned and agreed:
ACTION ITEM 05-04/005-a – Dr. Showers by 15 May shall provide to Bob DeLisi a draft of C63.16 containing the ballot comments.
ACTION ITEM 05-04/005-b – Bob DeLisi by 1 June shall arrange in the proper Format the document provided by Dr. Showers.
ACTION ITEM 05-04/005-c – Mike Violette and Jeff Silberberg by 1 July shall have reviewed the document received from Bob DeLisi and made necessary technical changes.
ACTION ITEM 05-04/005-d – Ken Hall by 15 July shall have arranged for the H-P editor to have reviewed the document received from Mike and Jeff and to have made necessary editorial changes.
ACTION ITEM 05-04/005-e – The Secretary by 1 August shall initiate a C63 ballot on the revised C63.16 document received from Ken Hall.

5.9
C63.17 – Unlicensed Personal Commun. Services Devices – Stephen Berger reported that SC7 is being reformed – see Item 8.6 below. He then stated that a Working Group of SC7 has prepared a draft document C63.17, and the Invitation to Ballot thereon has been issued by the Secretariat with a closing date of 9 May 2005. Next, Stephen moved that C63 approve SC7 to send a comment to the FCC recommending a petition change in Rule 15.323(c) from 50 dB to 65 dB above thermal noise. The Chair requested that the comment first be sent to the C63 Steering Committee.
[Motion passed]

5.10
C63.19 – EMC Hearing Aids, etc. – Stephen Berger reported that the latest C63.19 ballot had closed with no disapprovals, and that the Secretary has since initiated ANSI Public Review on the document, the closing date for which is 6 June.
[NOTE of the Secretary: Owing to an error by ANSI Staff in listing how the Draft could be purchased and the resulting delay in its public availability, ANSI has corrected the error and extended the closing date to 20 June.]
Stephen then noted that C63/SC8 had sent a petition to the FCC requesting that the FCC accept testing to the Draft Standard C63.19-2005 prior to its final approval by ANSI, and the FCC has issued a Public Notice to that effect (DA 05-1134, 25 April 2005).
5.11
C63.22 – Guide for Automated EMI Meas. - PINS for Revision - Werner Schaefer described briefly the work in SC1 on revising C63.22 and planning for the next step, viz., automation. He then displayed a PINS for this work [See Attachment 4], and moved for approval. There was a suggestion to change the title from “EMC Measurements” to “EMI Measurements, which was agreed, and, after a second,
[Motion, as revised, passed]

5.12
C63.23 – Measurement Uncertainty – Mike Windler reported that he and Ed Bronaugh had been assigned to prepare comments and a revised document for this failed ballot, but Ed had since resigned from C63.  With the help of Bob DeLisi and Tim Harrington of the FCC, he expected to prepare the necessary documentation for a new ballot.

ACTION ITEM 05-04/006 – Mike Windler shall provide to the Secretary a revised Draft of C63.23 for a new ballot on C63.23 prior to the next meeting of C63.

6.0  Old Business
6.1 Narrow Band – Broadband Issues (Ultra-wide band) – The Chair noted that he regretted 
that he had no report on this Item.

6.2
Power-Line Carrier – Ed Hare presented his report on this Item [See Attachment 5], which included information on other standards activity on this subject such as the IEEE Standards Association, the IEEE-EMCS, and CISPR which is starting from scratch. The Chair asked what role might be expected for C63, and Ed replied that the consensus appears to be: not much more than the present monitoring activity. The Chair noted that the topic is included in the long-range planning activity of the C63 Steering Committee, and asked Ed if he was willing to write a white paper on how BPL is being addressed by worldwide standards groups; Ed agreed.
ACTION ITEM 05-04/007 – Ed Hare shall prepare by one month prior to the next meeting a white paper on how BPL is being addressed by worldwide standards groups.

7.0 FCC Related Matters – No one was present from the FCC and no written report had been 
submitted. The Chair requested the Secretary to contact Bill Hurst to determine if a Report might be available.
[NOTE of the Secretary – Bill Hurst has provided a Report] [See Attachment 6]
8.0  
Subcommittee reports (SC Chairs were requested to please submit brief written reports based on Project Schedules)

8.1  
SC1  Measurement and Instrumentation – Don Heirman presented, and summarized his SC1 Report [See Attachment 7] He also presented the SC1 Membership list [See Attachment 8] , and moved that it be approved.

[Motion passed] 

Don noted that a second motion for C63 cited in the report would be dealt with later in the meeting. He next mentioned the Training Session on Monday. Stephen Berger reported very favorably on the Session, and strongly recommended that when a new C63 standard is initiated, it should be done in the new format at the start. Then Don assumed:
ACTION ITEM 05-04/008 – Don Heirman shall write IEEE-SA Staff thanking them for th excellent presentation at the C63 Training Session, noting that the Session was very well received by the C63 Members in attendance.
8.2 SC2  Definitions - Upgrading of C63.14 – Dave  Southworth presented his Report 
[See Attachment 9]. He then presented the new modified Scope for SC2 as given in Slide 3 of Attachment 9, and moved that it be approved.
[Motion passed]
Dave then described his action plan, to review new C63 standards and Mil Stds, with a plan to present a document toC63 two months prior to our next meeting.
ACTION ITEM 05-04/009 – Dave Southworth shall submit to C63 by the end of July 2005 a SC2 Draft document. 
Next Dave submitted for the record a new copy of the PINS form for C63.14.[See Attachment 10]. Don Heirman pointed out for information, that IEEE and IEC are in very early stages of discussing a common vocabulary. In conclusion, Dave pointed out that since C63 had earlier approved SC2 membership as the Chair of each C63 SC, he had explicitly prepared the SC2 Membership List as given in Slide 12 of Attachment 9 and moved that it be approved.

[Motion passed]

At the same time, the Chair assigned;

ACTION ITEM 05-04/010 – Each C63 SC Chair shall formally identify the individual from its SC that is assigned as a member of SC2.

8.3 SC3  International Standardization – John Lichtig reported on the activities of SC3 
[See Attachment 11]. Although the scope of SC3 was approved at the C63 April 2004 meeting, criteria for membership on SC3. had still not been developed; he assumed

ACTION ITEM 05-04/011 – John Lichtig shall develop criteria for membership on C63/SC3 and by one month prior to the next C63 meeting shall communicate those criteria to C63.
Nevertheless, John presented a membership list for SC3. and moved that it be approved. Don Heirman objected, on the grounds that some members listed there had not paid their C63 fees. The motion was changed to approve those members that have paid their fees.

[Motion passed]

8.4 SC5  In situ immunity testing - PINS for Std on Immunity of Office Equipment – Ed 
Hare reported on SC5 [See Attachment 12]. First, he moved that the membership list be approved.
[Motion passed]

Ed then noted that SC5 has one WG on Immunity of Office Equipment, led by Stephen Berger which is progressing rapidly and expects to have a draft ready for ballot by July 2005. This project requires a PINS, which Ed presented [See Attachment 13] and moved that it be approved. This generated considerable discussion, e.g., on the scope, definition of some terms, question of similar work in IEC SC77B, etc.
[Motion passed, but with three negative votes: Hoolihan, ITI, and Lucent]. 
The Chair ruled that the Secretary should hold the PINS and not send it to ANSI. It then was moved and seconded that SC5 should revise the PINS and submit the revision to the Secretariat for an e-mail ballot of C63.
{Motion passed, one abstention]
ACTION ITEM 05-04/012 – Ed Hare shall provide a revised PINS from SC5 on Immunity of Office Equipment to the Secretary to conduct an e-mail ballot of the PINS in C63.
8.5 SC6  Laboratory Accreditation – Dan Hoolihan reported that SC6 had met on 
Wednesday, and he displayed the SC6 Membership List [See Attachment 14] and moved that it be approved.
[Motion passed]
Dan then briefly summarized activities at the SC6 meeting [For Minutes of that meeting See Attachment 15]. There has been little progress in Working Group WG1, Check List for Lab Assessors, and in WG3, Proficiency Testing. He then called attention to the Status Report from the Accreditation organization A2LA [See Attachment 16]
8.6 SC7  Unlicensed Personal Communications Services (UPCS) – Stephen Berger reported 
on SC7, which is just getting underway, displaying first the Scope [See Attachment 17], and moving that it be approved.
[Motion passed]. 

and then the Membership List  [See Attachment 18], noting that one member had not yet paid his membership fee. He then moved to approve the List, subject to receiving payment for the one member.

[Motion passed].

 
8.7
SC8  Medical Equipment Testing – Dan Hoolihan first displayed the SC8 membership List [See Attachment 19], and moved that it be accepted.
[Motion passed].

He then reported on the meeting on Wednesday. [See Attachment 20], citing three Draft Standards. C63.18 progress continues to be slow. The Chair of the WG dealing with C63.21 has resigned, and Bob DeLisi is exploring the possibility of assuming the Chair. C63.19 has been dealt with above. Attention now is focused on adding three requirements to C63.19, which subject was addressed by Stephen Berger who displayed a PINS-C [See Attachment 21]. Dan moved that it be approved by C63.
[Motion passed].

9.0
Other Business

9.1 Liaison between C63 and TIA – Don Heirman reported that perhaps we should invite a 
TIA member to a C63 Meeting, with the goal of having TIA become a member of C63.  The Secretary noted that TIA had already requested liaison status with C63. Chrys Chrysanthou noted that he was a member of TIA committee TR41, and offered to assist. In the end two Action items were assigned:

ACTION ITEM 05-04/013 – Chrys Chrysanthou shall explore the possibility of TIA’s becoming a C63 member and report at the next meeting of C63 on his progress.
ACTION ITEM 05-04/014  – Don Heirman shall contact Dan Bart of TIA and explore the possibility of TIA’s becoming a C63 member and report at the next meeting of C63 on his progress.
9.2
Future Seminars and Workshops – Don Heirman displayed the status 
report presented at the November 2004 C63 meeting, which was still current, but Don noted one addition, viz., a seminar in Chicago in the week preceding the EMC Symposium there. Don also noted that C63.17 had been used at a conference that was a cooperative venture with NARTE , and that he has been looking into a several-day seminar in which a different C63 standard was treated each day.

9.3
Administrative Matters – The Secretary reported that his most urgent issue was that C63 members should please respond to e-mail memos, citing the fact that he had to issue the memo on November 2004 Action Items assigned to all C63 members four times and still had only a fifty percent response. In addition, he again requested C63 members to please advise the Secretary when their Representatives changed and when there was a change in an e-mail address of a Representative.
9.4 Review of Action Items not otherwise on the agenda – The Secretary reported that to his 
knowledge there were no outstanding action items other than those cited in the agenda for this meeting, but admitted that his attention had been devoted to trying .to get responses to the five items assigned to all members at the last meeting. In conclusion, the Chair requested the Action Item
ACTION ITEM 05-04/015 – The Chair shall review Action Items of previous meetings and report at the next meeting.

9.5 Newsletter – Comments and Proposals – Warren Kesselman reported,
[See Attachment 22], briefly summarizing previous Newsletters, and noting that inputs for the next Newsletter were due by 28 May. Jeff Silberberg suggested that draft Newsletters be reviewed before publication, because of a recent error in an item regarding his work, but Dan Hoolihan disagreed, taking full responsibility for submitting that item to the Editor. In the end, no action was taken.

9.6 C63 SC web pages – The Chair reported that the Steering Committee believes that the 
web site needs some improvement, and that the Chair will contact Bob Hofmann to discuss this issue.

9.7 Editing Committee Report – The Chair reported that the Editing Committee is beginning 
to function and that he is optimistic. He then assigned:
ACTION ITEM 05-04/016 – Mike Windler shall provide a report of the Editing Committee at the next C63 meeting.

9.8 Succession Plan Implementation – Dan Hoolihan displayed the Succession Plan, Draft 6 
[See Attachment 23], briefly reviewed past action on the Plan by C63, and noted that the Implementation of the Succession Plan had been deferred. He pointed out a few changes in the Plan made by the Steering Committee so that the Succession Plan was consistent with the C63 Procedures, and moved that the Succession Plan Draft 6 be approved.

[Motion passed]

Dan then described the Implementation Plan that had been agreed by the Steering Committee: In the C63 parent committee, Dr. Showers will resign at the end of 2005, and will be succeeded by the present Vice Chair, Don Heirman.

In the Subcommittees of C63, changes will be made over a three-year cycle, so that there are some changes in officers each year. Dan also pointed out that since Vice Chairs of Subcommittees very likely could become SC Chairs, each Vice Chair had to be approved by vote of the parent Committee C63. Accordingly, Don Heirman, as Chair of SC1, moved that Mike Windler be approved by C63 as Vice Chair of SC1.
[Motion passed]

Similarly, Dave Southworth, current Chair of SC2, moved that Marcus Shellman be approved by C63 as Vice Chair of SC2.
[Motion passed]

There being no other proposals for Vice Chair approvals at this time, the Chair assigned
ACTION ITEM 05-04/017 – Chairs of SC 3, 5, 6, 7 and 8 shall recommend Vice Chairs for approval by C63 as soon as possible.
Dan next reported the implementation sequence for successions in the SCs as recommended by the Steering Committee, i.e., the SC Chair would resign and be succeeded by its Vice Chair

o SC1 at the beginning of 2006, 2009, etc.
o SC2, 6 & 8 at the beginning of 2007, 2010, etc.
o SC3, 5, & 7  at the beginning of 2008, 2011, etc.
Very considerable discussion followed, during which it was pointed out that the Succession Plan specifically allowed the Chair of a Subcommittee to renew for a second three-year term with the approval of the parent committee C63. Hence, the schedules cited above could be modified accordingly.
9.9 Interpretations – Status of - Don Heirman briefly described the status of  interpretations 
in C63. There had been six requests, all concerned with Standard C63.4, which was the responsibility of SC1. As Chair of SC1, and in accordance with ANSI procedures, Don had reviewed each request and had decided that the submitted request for interpretation was actually an explanation. A detailed Explanation then was prepared, documented, and sent back to the individual who had made the request.

10.0 Adjournment - The meeting was formally adjourned at 16:35h.
*********************************************************************************
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